Kelly Cobian, Procurement Manager Materials Management Office Section:
E-Mail: kcobian@mmo.sc.gov 1201 Main St — Ste 600 Page:
Telephone: (803) 737-5473 Columbia, SC 29201 Date: 4/21/2017

CONTRACT FOR APPLIANCES, HOUSEHOLD
Contract Period: March 13, 2017 through November 9, 2020

Solicitation: 5400010058
Description:  STATEWIDE APPLIANCES

SPECIAL INSTRUCTIONS

Awards have been made to two vendors for each product category. End users may order from either vendor in a specific category. If a specific
product within a category is not listed on the contract, or is no longer available, it may be purchased from either of the listed contractors at the
current list price less the specified discount.

INSIDE DELIVERY:
All appliances are to be delivered to a specified location inside the building, uncrated, set in place, set correct door swing (if applicable), and all
cartons, wrappings, crating will be removed at no additional charge. The Solid Waste Act requires surcharge of $2.00 to be added to invoice.

CONTRACTORS

Haier US Appliances Solutions. Inc. Business Services

P.O Box 281865 P. O. Box 122775

Atlanta, GA 30384-1865 San Diego, CA 92112-2775

Attn: Rusha Miles Attn: Terry Brunning

Phone: (502) 452-3556 Phone: (619) 366-1794

rusha.miles@geappliances.com Terry@BusinessServicesSolutions.org

Vendor Number: 7000036464 Vendor Number: 7000098156

Contract: 4400015584 Contract: 4400015582
Products: Products:
Refrigerators/Freezers Microfridge
Ranges Compact Refrigerators
Microwave Ovens Washers & Dryers
Dishwashers 10% Discount

15% Discount


mailto:kcobian@mmo.sc.gov
mailto:rusha.miles@geappliances.com
mailto:Terry@BusinessServicesSolutions.org

SOLICITATION# 5400010058
STATEWIDE APPLIANCE CONTRACT

Appliance Category # | LOT Description General Electric | Business Model #
Services
04552 Ovens Microfridge combination appliance
1 Microwave and 1 2.8 -3.9 cu. ft. Refrigerator/Freezer; NO BID $459.98 S6MFA4A-TTP (BSY
. . GE- NO BID
Convection (Household) .7 cu. ft. microwave
04566 - Refrigerators and Refrigerator, Compact, with freezer HC45SG42SW (BS)/
2 Freezers ! 3.5-4.6 cu. ft. $203.00 $229.98 GE- GMEO4GGH
; Refrigerator, Top Mount, HPS15BTHRWYV (BS)/
3 | 04566 - Refrigerators and $489.00 $489.98
Freezers 2 14.5-15.5 cu ft GE- GTE15GTH
: Refrigerator, Top Mount, HPS18BTHWW (BS)/
4 | 04566 - Refrigerators and $621.00 $539.98
Freezers 2 17.5-18.5 cu ft GE- GTE18ETH
; Refrigerator, Top Mount, WRT519SZDW (BS)/
5 | 04566 - Refrigerators and $818.00 $649.98
Freezers 2 20.5-22.5 cu ft GE- GTE21GTH
. Refrigerator, Side by Side, FFS82314QE (BS)/
04566 - Refrigerators and
6 g 19.5-21.5 cu ft $878.00 $969.98 GE- GTE21GTH
Freezers 2
; Refrigerator, Side by Side, FFSS2314QE (BS)/
7 | 04566 - Refrigerators and $1,204.00 $969.98
Freezers 2 21.5-225 cu ft GE- GSE22ETH
04566 - Refrigerators and Freezer, Chest, (Manual Defrost) W2C5422DW (BS)/
8 Freezers 2 23-25 cu ft NO BID $809.98 GE- NO BID
04566 - Refrigerators and Freezer, Upright, (Frost Free) WZF56R16DW (BS)/
9 Freezers 2 16.5-17.5 cu ft $643.00 $629.98 FUF17DHRWW (GE)
- i ight, (Frost Free
10 04566 - Refrigerators and 5 Freezer, Upright, (Fros ) $797.00 $669.98 FFFH20F2QW (BS)/

Freezers

20.5-21.5 cu ft

GE- FUF21DLRWW




04566 - Refrigerators and

Refrigerator (Stand Alone -

KEN- #70722 (BS)/

11
Freezers Freezerless), 15-20 cu ft NO BID $649.98 GE- NO BID
1o | 04554 - Range Stove Tops Range, Conventional Oven, KEN- #94152 (BS)/
and Oven Electric 4.1 cu ft $444.00 $569.98 GE- JBS10DF
13 | 04554 - Range Stove Tops Range, Conventional Oven, KEN- #94152 (BS)/
and Oven Electric 4.6 cu ft (30" Electric Range) $483.00 $569.98 GE- JBS45DF
14 | 04954 - Range Stove Tops Range, Conventional Oven, GE- RA720KWH (BS)/
and Oven Electric 2.4 cu ft (20" Electric Range) $404.00 $509.98 GE- N/A
15 | 04554 - Range Stove Tops Drop-In Range, Self-Clean Oven, JM250DFWW (BS)/
and Oven Electric 3.0 cu ft (27" Electric Range) $1,067.00 $1,329.98 GE- N/A
1 | 04954 - Range Stove Tops Range, Self-Clean Oven, KEN- 94152 (BS)/
and Oven Electric 5.3 cu ft (27" Electric Range) $426.00 $569.98 GE- JBS255DJ
. Ovens- Microwave and Convection
17 1992 - Ovens, Micronave Oven, .7 cu ft (Household- CMW-100 (BS)/
Microwave) $104.00 $209.98 GE- JEM3072DH
04552 - Ovens, Microwave Ovens- Microwave and Convection
18 . Oven, 1.1-1.3 cu ft (Household- CMW-200 (BS)/
and Convection .
Microwave) $115.00 $219.98 GE- JES1145SH
< [Pz o |, | O e
and Convection T ECO42ASF (BSY
Microwave) $208.00 $309.98 GE- PEB7226DF
. Dishwashers,
20 04524 - Dishwashers 24 inch (Household) GE- HDA3600HWW (BS)/
$334.00 $309.98 GE- GSD3300DF




% Discount- Dishwashers

21 04524 - Dishwashers
5.00% 10.00%
- 04594 - Washers and Washer, Laundry (Top Load)
Dryers (Residential) 3.2 cu ft (Residential) HSWP1000MWV (BS)/
$427.00 $359.98 GE- GTW180SCJ
23 04594 - Was_hers f';md Dryer, Lau_ndry_ HTDX100EDWW(BS)/
Dryers (Residential) 6.0 cu ft (Residential) $427.00 $389.98 GE- GTXI18ESSJ

Additional Note to Offeror: All appliances in bid schedule (excluding
microfridges) will include delivery, installation/ setup and removal of trash.

Each of the major appliances will be delivered with their applicable

accessories; such asrange electrical cords, dishwasher installation kits,
washer hoses, dryer ducts and automatic ice maker kits, if applicable. The bid

schedulereflects accessories for the identified appliances.

BS= BUSINESS SERVICES

GE= GENERAL ELECTRIC
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